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Executive Report 
Canterra Energy Ltd., a new 
presence in the Canadian petro- 
leum industry, is pleased to 
present its first annual report. 

In mid-1981, Canada Develop- 
ment Corporation (CDC) and 
Elf Aquitaine entered into several 
transactions by which the two 
groups re-arranged their respec- 
tive assets in the oil and mining 
business in North America. As a 
result of these transactions, 
CDC acquired the shares of 
Aquitaine Company of Canada 
and the Canadian assets of 
Texasgulf Inc. while Elf 
Aquitaine acquired the assets of 
Texasgulf in the United States 
and other foreign countries. 

The Canterra Group, wholly- 
owned by CDC, is the combina- 
tion of Aquitaine Company of 
Canada, CDC Oil & Gas and 
the oil, gas and sulphur 
operations of Texasgulf 
in Canada. 

Canterra has the size, the 
diversity of assets and the skills 
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to be a major and leading force 
in the Canadian petroleum 
industry. 

With close to $3 billion of 
assets, Canterra is the fourth 
largest Canadian-owned petro- 
leum company. Canterra is 
present in all facets of the 
industry: exploration in the 
three petroleum provinces of 
western Canada and in the 
frontier offshore plays, as well 
as conventional, tertiary and 
heavy oil production, and in-situ 
recovery from the oilsands. 
Canterra is the largest supplier 
and marketer of sulphur in 
Canada, controlling directly or 
indirectly 20 per cent of the 
world's trade in sulphur. 

In the United States, Canterra is 
also active in oil and gas explo- 
ration and production and in the 
coal industry. 

We strongly believe that Canada 
has excellent hydrocarbon 
potential: the western Canada 
basins have still only been 
drilled at one tenth the density 

of their United States 
counterparts, and the frontier 
areas are significant plays by 
any world comparison. 

Canterra is well positioned to 
contribute to the development of 
these resources and to take 
advantage of many growth 
opportunities. 

Canterra is also the only major 
diversified petroleum company 
with 100 per cent Canadian 
ownership which operates under 
the rules and conditions of the 
private sector and competes in 
the market place. As such, we 
are accountable for the 
profitability of our operations. 
Yet we also feel we have a 
particular responsibility to 
express to governments, in a 
constructive manner, our 
opinion on the regimes that 
would be appropriate to better 
realize the potential of the 
energy resources of Canada. In 
this respect we have been, and 
are presently, making such 
expressions to the governments. 





































Sulphur 
Canterra's sulphur sales in 1981 
were 1.8 million tonnes. This 
was made up of 800 000 tonnes 
of production, 450 000 tonnes 
of purchases and 550 000 tonnes 
of product taken from inventory. 
At 1 500 000 tonnes, the off- 
shore market continued to 
comprise the major market area 
with the North American 
markets accounting for the 
remaining 300 000 tonnes. 

The Canterra group delivers 
sulphur to market from several 
natural gas processing plants in 
Alberta with largest volumes 
coming from Ram River, 
Windfall and Okotoks. 
Construction of the prilliig 
tower at Ram River was 
completed in the summer of 
1981. Sulphur prills are an 
excellent product as they are 
almost dust free in both the 
forming tower and during 
handling. Although the tower 
has a capacity of 3 300 tonnes 
per day, it is currently operating 
at around 2 000 tonnes per day 

with production rising as 
improvements and design 
modifications are made. 

As indicated above, a reduction 
in stock inventories continued to 
supply a significant portion of 
the tonnage sold in 1981 with 
remaining inventories at year 
end totalling 4 100 000 tonnes. 
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During 1981, Canterra establish- 
ed an office in Pittsburgh, Pa. to 
handle United States sulphur 
sales. Thii office is an addition 
to staff located in Calgary who 
are responsible for Canadian 
sales, management of Canberra's 
liquid sulphur rail car fleet of 
275 cars, and co-ordination of 
formed product shipments to 
Vancouver for export. Canterra 
is represented in the offshm 
market by Cansulex Limited 

which is a Vancouver based 
sulphur marketing firm 
comprised of 16 Alberta 
producers. 

Coal I 
Canterra's coal operations are 
centered around Pittsburgh, 
Pennsylvania. Until the fall of 
1981 demand for both steam and 
metallurgical coal remained 
strong due to the stockpiling and 
replenishment of coal inventories 
in advance of, and following, 
the 72day miners' strike during 
the spring and summer. In 
addition the export market for 
steam coal expanded, especially 
to Europe. In the fourth quarter, 
however, both domestic and 
export markets started to soften 
as a result of the world-wide 
economic slowdown. 

The net effect, in spite of the 
strike which affected under- 
ground operations, was a ship- 
ment level only eight percent 
lower than that achieved in 1980 
and the second highest in the 
company's history. Total coal 
revenues were up 4.7 per cent. 
























